
Outstanding Achievement Award 
Scoring Rubric 
 
Please place a numerical rating for each criteria category 
under each nominee’s name 
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Score Score Description Criteria  
4 Absolutely The nominee has attained 

outstanding success in the 
program to which he/she was 
assigned and/or involved other 
programs and fields of public 
health. 

   
3 Mostly 
2 Somewhat 
1 A little bit 
0 Not at all 
4 Absolutely 

The nominee’s success required 
unusual effort and long hours of 
work and personal sacrifices. 

   
3 Mostly 
2 Somewhat 
1 A little bit 
0 Not at all 
4 Absolutely The nominee’s achievement is 

outstanding in comparison to 
other individual efforts in the 
same field of endeavor, related 
fields, or entirely different fields 
within the overall public health 
effort.  

   

3 Mostly 

2 Somewhat 

1 A little bit 

0 Not at all 
4 Absolutely 

The nominee’s achievement is 
verified and documented.    

3 Mostly 
2 Somewhat 
1 A little bit 
0 Not at all 

4 Four or more pieces 
of documentation 

The nominator provided 
documentation of the nominee’s 
accomplishment(s) (copies of 
reports, newspaper articles, 
tabulations, statistics, etc.) for 
review. 

   

3 Three pieces of 
documentation 

2 Two pieces of 
documentation 

1 One piece of 
documentation 

0 No documentation 
Column Totals    

 


